NOTICE AND AGENDA

March 17, 2020

Notice is hereby given that the Roosevelt City Council will hold its regular Council Meeting on Tuesday, March 17, 2020, at the
Roosevelt Municipal Building, 255 South State Street, Roosevelt, Utah, which meeting shall begin promptly at 5:30 p.m.

The agenda will be as follows:

1. Call to Order Page
2. RollCall

Opening Ceremony (Prayver and Pledge of Allegiance)

-
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5. Public Comment Period (The comment period is limited to 15 minttes. Any person wishing fo comment shall limit their comments to
three (3) minwies. Any person wishing to comment during the comment period shall request recognition by the Mayar. Upon recogaition,
the citizen shall approach the front and state his/her rame and address for the record. All comments shall be divected to the Mayor or
entive Conncil, No person addressing the City Council during the comment period shall be allowed to comment miore than once during
that contment periad. Speakers should not expect any debate with the Mayor, City Council or City Staff; however, the Mayor, City
Council or City Staff may respond within the 15-mintte period. During this time, citizens may address the Conneil on any subject.)

6. Public Hearings {as needed)
A. Ordinance 2020-435 — Amending City Code Title 2 Chapter 4: Administration and Personnel, City Manager 4-7

7. Appointments

A. Airport FAA Contract Change Order Change #3

B. Appointment/Reappointment of City Committee Members

C. Vehicle Allowance Policy........... f et er e r e . v 8-10
D. Bid Award 500 East Sidewalk Project.......cccoviviiivninniiinnn, e er e e e e I1-15
E. City Recorder Position Selection

8. Purchase Orders and Quarterly Financial Review
9. Reports from Standing Committees

10. Report from City Manager

11. Standing Agenda Items

A, Pending Discussion Items (discussed previously, but final action not yet taken)
1. Chapter by chapter detail review of city code

12, Closed Session (as needed)
13. Adjourn

Further Information can be obtained by contacting Carolyn Wilcken at {435) 722-5001 or (435} 725-7203. In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities
Act, indlviduals needing special accommodations (including auxifiary communicative alds and services} during these hearings should notify
Carolyn Wilcken at 255 South State Street, Roosevelt, Utah, 84066, at least three days prior to the hearing to be attended.




MINUTES OF A REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING
February 18, 2020
The meeting was called to order at 5:30 p.m. by Mayor JR Bird.

A roll call was taken which showed council members Dustin White, David Baird, Don
Busenbark, Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland present. Mayor JR Bird stated that the meeting was a
regularly called meeting and that notice of the time, place and agenda of the meeting had been
provided to the local news media, to each member of the governing body, and was posted on the
city web page and the state public meetings web page.

Others present included Acting City Manager Ryan Clayburn, City Recorder Carolyn Wilcken,
Acting Finance Director/Assistant City Manager Randy Robb, Dean Johnson, Kirby Wolfinjer,
Hal Huff, Dusty Anderton, Mark Tervort, Patrick Corun, Melissa Yergensen, Matt Ferensen, and
Wayne Malnar,

Opening prayet was given by Ryan Clayburn.
MINUTES

A motion was made by Councilman Don Busenbark to approve the minutes of the regular
meeting of January 21, 2020, as presented. Motion was seconded by Councilman John Aland.
Those voting Aye were, Dustin White, David Baird, Don Busenbark, Vince Reiley, and Cody
Aland. Motion was carried unanimously.

PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD

Hal Huff stated that he has a drainage problem in his driveway where the snow has been piled and
is now melting, causing ice in his driveway. This is caused from plowing the snow off 800 South
and he is asking that next winter this problem be considered when plowing the snow in front of
his home.

PUBLIC HEARING — CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT - MOON LAKE ELECTRIC ASSN.

Mayor JR Bird explained that although this is a scheduled public hearing, it has been determined
that it found to be unnecessary. Since zoning ordinances are already approved, if the Planning
and Zoning Commission approves a conditional use permit, there is no need to come before
Council unless the applicant protests the conditions, Mayor Bird explained that Council is an
appeals board to hear protests to Planning and Zoning decisions. Since this was already
advertised as a hearing, Mayor Bird stated Council would listen to any public comments. Moon
Lake Electric Assn. has requested a conditional use permit to construct a new electrical substation
to be located at 2407 South State Street. Planning and Zoning recommended approval by City
Council for the conditional use permit with five conditions as follows: 1. Road access and
construction, 2. Site obscuring fencing, 3. A letter stating they will install curb and gutter and/or
matching improvements with neighbors once the area is improved and developed, 4. A turnaround
for emergency vehicles, and 5. Notification to neighbors of the City Council Public Hearing. It
was determined that 1. Moon Lake has their own minimum specifications for the road which are
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more stringent than the city requires, 2. A site obscuring fence is not required by city ordinance,
3. Any curb and gutter and/or matching improvements with neighbors would be covered by a
special service district, 4. There isn’t really a need for a turnaround at this time. Mayor Bird
opened up the public hearing portion of the meeting. Wayne Malnar stated that he would like the
site obscuring fence requirement upheld since his property is near the project. Mayor Bird stated
that the only purpose to meet with the Council is if Moon Lake wants to appeal the site obscuring
fence requirement voted on by Planning and Zoning. This would require being placed on the next
Council agenda since a protest wasn’t shown on the city council agenda for this meeting. Moon
Lake representative Patrick Corun stated that they would prefer to agree to the site obscuting
fence rather than have to return to the next meeting.

HUMAN RESQURCES CONTRACT

City Council previously authorized entering into a contract for human resource services. At the
end of the process, it was determined that Melissa Yergensen would be the best person to perform
these services and fulfil Roosevelt City’s requirements. It is now necessary to enter into a formal
contract. After review and discussion, a motion was made by Councilman Dustin White to accept
signing a contract for human resource services with Melissa Yergensen. Motion seconded by
Councilman David Baird. Those voting Aye were Dustin White, David Baird, Don Busenbark,
Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland. Motion was carried unanimously.

VEHICLE LEASE ALLOWANCE POLICY

Acting City Manager Ryan Clayburn explained to City Council the process of preparing the proposed
vehicle lease allowance policy. He explained that this was drafted from the previous vehicle lease
allowance policy. After review and discussion, a motion was made by Councilman Vince Reiley to
approve this policy with the addition of a 4-wheel drive requirement and yearly inspection. There
were further concerns expressed. There was no second to the motion. A motion was then made by
Councilman Don Busenbark to table this matter until the concerns can be addressed. Motion
seconded by Councilman Dustin White. Those voting Aye were Dustin White, David Baird, Don
Busenbark, Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland. Motion carried unanimously.

TITLE II - REVISIONS TO CITY CODE DISCUSSION

Councilman David Baird stated that he and Councilman Vince Reiley have reviewed Title IT of city
code and made revisions. A motion was made by Councilman Don Busenbark to move thistoa
public hearing for the next Council Meeting. Motion seconded by Councilman Vince Reiley. Those
voting Aye were Dustin White, David Baird, Don Busenbark, Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland.
Motion carried unanimously.

PURCHASE ORDERS

A motion was made by Councilman Vince Reiley to approve the following purchase orders.
Motion seconded by Councilman Cody Aland. Those voting Aye were Dustin White, David
Baird, Don Busenbark, Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland. Motion carried unanimously.
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Duchesne County Water Conservancy Dist. $ 27,530.18
2709 Duchesne County Water Conservancy Dist.  198,000.00

77160 J-U-B Engineering 10,000.00
J-U-B Engineering 39,483.90
PEHP 47,500.00
K 7 K Sanitation 73,636.88
Moon Lake Electric 13.174.56
Siddons-Martin Emergency Group 48.000.00

TOTAL $457,325.52

STANDING COMMITTEE REPORTS

Mayor Bird suggested the following assignments:

Mosquito Abatement - David Baird

Arts, Park & Rec — Cody Aland and Don Busenbark
Airport — Vince Reiley and Mayor JR Bird

EDC — Vince Reiley and Dustin White

Emergency Management —- David Baird and Vince Reiley
Water - Cody Aland and Dustin White

City Beautification - Don Busenbark and Cody Aland
ULCT — Dustin White

Planning and Zoning — Don Busenbark and Mayor JR Bird
Finance — David Baird and Mayor JR Bird

UBAOG -~ Mayor JR Bird

CITY MANAGER REPORT

Acting City Manager Ryan Clayburn reported the City Recorder position has been advertised.
The 500 East Sidewalk project has gone out to bid. The golf course will be opening soon,
depending on weather. The city’s web site is being upgraded to be easier to navigate. The
budget is being prepared for the new budget year.

A motion was made by Councilman David Baird to adjourn the meeting. Motion seconded by
Councilman Vince Reiley. Those voting Aye were Dustin White, David Baird, Don Busenbark,
Vince Reiley, and Cody Aland. Motion carried unanimously.

Meeting adjourned at 7:40 p.m.

Roddy L. Bird Jr., Mayor

ATTEST:

Carolyn Wilcken, Recorder




ORDINANCE NO. 2020-435

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ROOSEVELT CITY CODE TITLE 2 CHAPTER 4:
ADMINISTRATION AND PERSONNEL, CITY MANAGER.

WHEREAS, revisions have been proposed to update Title 2 Chapter 4 of the Roosevelt
Municipal Code; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the proposed changes promote the efficiency of the city
administration of government; and

WHERTEAS, the efficient administration of government promotes the general health, safety and
welfare of residents and visitors of Roosevelt City; and

BE I'T THEREFORE RESOLVED that effective upon approval by the Roosevelt City Council
Title 2 Chapter 4 of the Roosevelt City Ordinances shall be updated and amended as follows and
the provisions below shall supersede any prior version of Title 2 Chapter 4. Anything not
contained herein was intentionally removed and deleted from prior versions by this revision:

2.04.010 Office created.

There is created the office of city manager of Roosevelt, Utah. The City Manager shall be the
chief administrative officer of the City acting under the oversight and direction of the Mayor.
(Ord. 2020-435: Ord. 2017-410 (part): Ord. 93-251 § 1)

2.04.020 Appointment.

The Mayor, with the advice and consent of the City Council, shall appoint a City Manager within
a reasonable time whenever a vacancy exists in such position. (Ord. 2020-435: Ord. 2017-410 (part):
Ord. 93-251§2)

2.04.030 Term.

Appointment of the City Manager shall be without definite term and shall be at a salary to be
fixed by City Council. The City Manager shall be appointed without regard to any consideration
other than his or her fitness, competency, training and experience. (Ord. 2020-435; Ord. 2017-410
(part): Ord. 93-251 § 3)

2.04.040 Residency

At the time of appointment, the City Manager need not be a resident of the City or state, but
within six (6) months of appointment and during all other tenure of office the City Manager shall
reside within the City except at the express exception of the City Council which shall only be
granted in extreme and/or emergency circumstances. (Ord. 2020-435)

2.04,050 Elected Officials Ineligible for Appointment
No member of the City Council nor the Mayor shall be appointed manager during the term for

which they shall have been elected, nor within one (1) year after the expiration of their term,
(Ord. 2020-435)
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2.04.060 Powers and duties.

The City Manager shall be responsible and under the control and supervision of the Mayor and the
City Council for the proper administration of all affairs of the City placed in their charge, and to
that end, shall have the power and duty and be required to:

A,

B
C.
D

£

oz X

?U

Be responsible for the enforcement of all Federal, State and Local laws which do not have
criminal penalties;

. Carry out the policies and programs established by the council.

Meet regularly with the Mayor and keep the Mayor apprised of developments in City
business.

. Inform Mayor of all executive level meetings as far in advance of the meeting as reasonably

practical and invite the mayor to attend same, “Executive level meetings” shall mean any
meeting with one or more department heads, the City Attorney and/or elected officials from
another governmental entity, business leaders efc..

Appoint, hire, suspend, transfer and remove all department heads employed by the City
except the following department heads shall be appointed or removed by the mayor with
the advice and consent of the city council: recorder, treasurer, police chief and city attorney.
Ensure that department heads appoint, hire, suspend, transfer and remove all employees
within their various departments.

Upon request of the Mayor or City Council make written or verbal reports at any time
concerning the affairs of the City under their supervision;

Keep the Mayor and the City Council advised of the financial condition and future needs
of the City and make such recommendations to the Mayor or Council for adoption as the
Manager may deem necessary or expedient;

With the advice and consent of the Mayor exercise supervision and control over all
executive and administrative departments, excepting legal, and implement any necessary
action to establish, consolidate or abolish administrative departments;

Be responsible for the enforcement of all terms and conditions imposed in favor of the City
in any contract or public utility franchise, and upon knowledge of any violation thereof,
report the same to the Mayor and City Council for such action and proceedings as may be
necessary to enforce the same;

Attend City Council meetings and participate in discussions with the Mayor and City
Council in an advisory capacity;

Provide for engineering, architectural, maintenance and construction services required by
the City; and

. Present all contracts the terms of which either expend or receive more than the amount set

by resolution, as amended, to the City Council for approval.

Ensure that all contracts entered into by the City are signed by the Mayor.

Notify the mayor and city council of any emergency existing in any department under his
supervision.

Declare a local emergency by proclamation for less than thirty (30) days unless approved
by the City Council and take disaster or emergency related actions as authorized by Utah
Code Ann. § 53-2a-201 et seq., the Disaster Response and Recovery Act, as amended, and
the City’s Emergency Response Plan; and
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Q. Perform such other duties as may be prescribed by ordinance or required of him or her by
the Mayor and City Council which are not inconsistent with the laws of the state. (Ord. 2020-
435: Ord. 2018-417 § 3; Ord, 2017-410 (part): Ord. 93-251 § 4)

2.04.070 Removal of the City Manager

The City Council, including the Mayor, may by majority vote, remove the City Manager from
office. Upon such termination, the City Council may, in their discretion, provide termination pay.
(Ord. 2020-435)

2.04.080 Relationship of Mayor and City Council to City Staff

A. The City Couneil, its members and the Mayor may make any reasonable inquiry of the
City Manager, Department Heads or other city employees to obtain information that it or
they may deem necessary to effectively and efficiently carry out its or their duties. The
City Manager, Department Head or other city employee shall respond at the earliest
reasonable opportunity at which the duties or their position will not be interrupted.

B. Neither the City Council, its members, the Mayor, nor any City Council committee shall
dictate hiring or firing by the City Manager of any person to any position except as
otherwise provided in this Code. Neither the City Council, its members, the Mayot, nor
any City Council committee shall interfere with the City Manager or other City officer or
employee to prevent them from exercising discretion in carrying out their duties. Except
for purposes of inquiry neither the City Council, its members, the Mayor, nor any City
Council committee shall direct or give orders to city staff, (Ord. 2020-435)

2.04.090 Role of the city council,

The city council shall pass all resolutions, ordinances, appropriate funds and adopt the annual
budget, set all mill levies or taxes, review municipal administration as set out herein, and
perform all duties that may be required of it by law. The city council may delegate to the city
manager any executive or administrative power held by the city council pursuant to the
applicable provisions of state law. (Ord. 2020-435: Ord. 2017-410 (part): Ord. 93-251 § 5)

2.04.100 Limitation of Terms of City Council Members.

No person shall serve more than eight (8) years on the City Council in any sixteen (16) yeat
period. In applying this section, service of the City Council resulting from an election prior to
January 1, 2020, or service of less than two years by a petson elected or appointed after the
effective date of this section to complete the term of another person, shall be counted. (Ord. 2020-
435)

2.04.110 Role of the mayor.

The mayor shall be the chief ceremonial officer of the city. He shall serve as chairman of the
governing body, He shall retain all legislative and judicial powers vested by law. He shall
appoint, with the advice and consent of the council, department heads (statutory appointments)
and any vacancies on commissions or committees of the municipality. The mayor may delegate
to the city manager any executive or administrative power held by the mayor pursuant to the
applicable provisions of state law. (Ord. 2020-435: Ord. 2017-410 (part): Ord. 93-251 § 6)
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2.04.120 Limitation of Terms of the Mayor.

No person shall serve more than eight (8) years as the Roosevelt City Mayor in any sixteen (16)
year period. In applying this section, service as the Mayor resulting from an election prior to
January 1, 2020, or service of less than two years by a person elected or appointed after the
effective date of this section to complete the term of another person, shall be counted. (Ord. 2020-
435)

2.04.130 Salary.

The salary of the city manager shall be set from time to time by city council. (Ord. 2020-435: Ord.
2017-410 (part): Ord. 93-251 § 7) |

PASSED AND APPROVED this day of , 2020, by the following vote:

Dustin White
David Baird
Don Busenbark
Vince Reiley
Cody Aland

ROOSEVELT CITY

Roddie I. Bird, Jr, Mayor
ATTEST:

Carolyn Wilcken, Recorder
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ROOSEVELT CITY
VEHICLE ALLOWANCE POLICY

Effective Date;

1. SUMMARY AND OBJECTIVES:

To provide an alternative to assignment of City vehicles, for those employees whose duties require
transportation, by offering a vehicle allowance to those who wish to utilize a personal vehicle in the
course of thelr employment with the City.

2. POLICY AND PROCEDURES:

This option shall be limited to the positions listed within this policy.

Eligible employees who elect notto use a personal vehicle, with a vehicle allowance, will be assigned a
vehicle owned by the City. After their initial election regarding which alternative they desire, eligible
employees may only change alternatives, pursuant to this policy including City Manager approval. The
City Manager’s participation in this program requires approval of the governing body.

Electing to receive a vehicle allowance shall require a four-year commitment from the employee. The
City Council has the discretion to discontinue this program at any time. However, should the governing
hody of the City decide to discontinue this policy four-years notice shall be given to employees who are
using personal vehicles at the time the policy is discontinued. Authorization from the Department of
Public Safety, granting emergency equipment use on privately owned vehicles shall be provided by the
employee and kept on file with the Chief of Police during the life of this policy.

This policy was made effective as of , 2020.

Eligible positions:

The following job positions are eligible to participate in this program with City Manager approval,
Assistant City Manager

The Police Chief

Public Works Director

Water Source Director
Zoning & Building Director

mo 0w >

The Chief Appointed Officer or City Manager with approval of the governing body.

3. REQUIREMENTS:

individuals opting for the vehicle allowance alternative must meet the following standards:

A. All vehicles used under this policy shall be five years or newer with iess than 100,000
accumulated miles. All vehicles must be in good condition and appearance. All vehicles must be
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approved in advance by the City Manager who is hereby authorized to impose requirements
specific to the job/function of the eligible employee.

vehicles shall be fully insured by the owner {employee), with liability, collision and
comprehensive insurance coverage at $50,000/%$300,000 levels and must be able to provide
proof of same on demand. At the beginning of each calendar year each employee on this
program must provide a certificate of insurance showing active coverage with no less than a
One Thousand Dollar {$1,000.00) deductible and the specified limits of liability. Employees will
provide the certificate to the City Manager or designee.

All vehicles will be maintained in a safe, neat and clean fashion and be available for use hoth day
and night. If an employee falils to maintain reasonable safety standards the City may
immediately revoke that employees eligibility forany and all provisions of this policy. The former
safety inspection standards utilized by the State of Utah for Vehicle Inspections shall be
recognized as the minimum safety standard of this policy. The City Manager may impose more
stringent standards upon thirty {30) days written notice to eligible employees.

Participating employees will be responsible for repair costs of any and all damages incurred to any
personal vehicle used pursuant to this policy. If a vehicle is out of service for maintenance not to
exceed thirty (30) days, a city vehicle may be used. Ifa vehicle is out of service for longer than
thirty (30) days then a city vehicle will be provided and the employee whose vehicle is out of
service must reimburse the City for any days in excess of thirty {30) days that a city vehicle is used.
The reimbursement rate shall be the monthly allowance divided by thirty (30} and multiplied by
the number of days a city vehicle is used less thirty (30).

Any emergency equipment required by the City such as radios, antennas, lights, sirens, or other
equipment, will be installed and maintained at the City's expense. The employee must properly
care for City equipment thus installed, Damage to the equipment resulting from abuse or
negligence shall be paid for by the employee.

Employees who elect to use personat vehicles pursuant to this policy shall use the approved
vehicle for all calls and/or assignments made, as they would a City owned vehicle, For business
travel in excess of 200 miles one way, a city vehicle may be used or the employee may submit
fue! receipts for reimbursement of a properly approved personal vehicle. No employee electing
to use a personal vehicle pursuant to this policy shall be eligible for mileage reimbursement.

Nothing in this agreement will require an employee to utilize a specific dealer to acquire a
suitable vehicle.

. All employees of Roosevelt City who drive City vehicles or who drive approved personal vehicles
under this policy shall maintain a valid and appropriate Utah driver’s license and shall maintain a
good driving record and shall enter into an Automobile Allowance Agreement.

The City Manager or designee shall maintain records of all employees electing to use approved
personal vehicles pursuant to this policy including a signed copy of the Automobile Allowance

Page 2 of 3




Agreement for each applicable employee. All eligible employees, who choose the personal
vehicle with allowance alternative, must commit in four year bocks. The City Manager may
waive an employee’s obligations pursuant to this policy upon demonstration of obvious,
extreme or other extenuating circumstances that would no longer make it feasible for an
employee’s continued participation.

4. REVOCATION FOR NON-COMPLIANCE:

Roosevelt City reserves the right to revoke authorization to utilize a personal vehicle and to discontinue
vehicle allowance payments to any employee for non-compliance with the terms of this policy. Prior to
discontinuing payments the employee will be given thirty (30) days notice of the policy violation and of
the City’s intent to discontinue payments and to revoke authorization to utilize a personal vehicle. If the
employee fails to comply with all terms of this policy within the thirty (30) day notice period then
authorization to use personal vehicle will be revoked and vehicle allowance payments will be
discontinued.

5. VEHICLE ALLOWANCE:

The monthly allowance paid to employees choosing that alternative shail be $800.00. The allowance
amount shall be subject to annual adjustment by the governing body. The City will reimburse eligible
employees for fuel for City business travel in excess of 200 miles one way pursuant to Section 3 {F}
herein. All other fuel and maintenance expenses shall be the responsibility of the employee.

6. DISCONTINUED EMPLOYMENT:

When an employee’s term of employment ends with the City for any reason, both voluntary and
involuntary, any applicable vehicle allowance shall be prorated to the date employment ended and will
be paid until but not beyond that date.

7. TAXES:
Vehicle allowance payments shall be subject to State and Federal taxes. Eligible employees will be

responsible to reporting and paying said taxes on their personal tax returns. Roosevelt City will not
offset vehicle allowance payments In any way for an employee’s personal tax obligations.
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CIVCO Engineering, Inc.
Civil Engineering Consultants
PO Box 1758 * 1256 W 400 S, Suite 1
Vernal, Utah 84078

March 5, 2620

Project Update
Bid Opening Results and Recommendations

On March 5, 2020 a bid opening was held for the Roosevelt City 500 East Sidewalk and Street
Light Project (CDBG). There were 12 Contractors that requested the project bid documents,
and three (3) of the contractors bid for this project. The bid results are as follows (for the
complete results, see attached bid tabulation sheets):

Farnsworth Excavation $ 178,571.83
Maverick Contractors $ 253,645.20
CKC Asphalt $ 304,119.00

The Engineer’s estimate for this project was $ 220,648.00.

Based on past work history with these contractors and checking references, it is the recommendation of
the project engineer that this project be awarded to Farnsworth Excavation in the amount of § 178,571.73. -

Phone (435)789-5448 * Fax (435)789-4485
Email: civco@civcoengineering.com




CiVCO Englneering, Inc.

P.O. Box 1758
Vernal, Utah 84078

Roosevelt City
500 East Sidewalk and Street Light Project {CDBG)

Engineer's Estimate

Htem Dsgcriplion Estim a! ad ot Engineer’s Estimate Jsll;nswunh Excavation
Number Quantity Unit Price Amount piice Amoual
1 Mabilization il Lump $20,000.00 $20,000.00 £8,821,78 38,021.78
2 Traffic Control 1 Lum| $10,000.00 $10,000,00 $6,000.00 $5,600.00
Silt Fence 500 Foat $2.00 $1,000.00 $17.00 $0,500.00
4 9* Fiber Rolf 50 Foot $6.00 $400.00 $6.00 $300.00
Reconstiuct Valve Box 4} Each 100.00 $100,00 $900.00 $900.00
Relocate Water Meter 5i Each $2.500.00 $12,600.00 $300.00 b4 500.00
Raconstruct Sprinkler Syslem 20]  Lump $500.03 0,000.00 $400.00 $6,000.00
8 Ramove Tree Each $450.00 1,350.00 $1,333,34 34,000.02
9 Remove Tree Stump Each $350.00 1,050.00 $500.00 1,600.00
10 |Femovs Fance Foot $60.00 $540.00 $50.66 $536,04
11 Relocats Fance 12 Foot $15.00 $1,905.00 $0.93 $1,261.11
2 Relocata Gate Each $250.00 $750.00 304,00 $900.00 |
3 Remove Concrate Sidewalk 18l 8q¥d $20.00 $360.00 155,50 $2.800.08 |
4 |Remove Conerete Curb 10] _ Fool $10.00 $100,00 160.00 $1,600.00 |
i6 Remeye Landscape Rock And Salvaje To Ovner 108] SuFt 55,00 30,00 $11.84 $1,265.84
B JRemove Brick Walk And Salvage To Owner 183] SqFt 7.00 $1,281.00 $7.56 | $1,456.68
7 Gravel Deveway 15| Each $800.00 $12,000.00 0.00 $5,260.00
L] Asphalt Contrete Driveway 2] _Each $1,200.00 $2,400.00 750.00 $1.500.00
~19 Comer Padestrian Accass Ramo 6] Each $3.500.00 $21,000.00 750,00 $4,500.00
20 Congrete Sidewalk 13454f SqFl $1.50 $94,178.00 7,12 $95,792.48
21 Concrete Driveway 13 Each $1,200.00 $15.600.00 $750.00 $9,760.00
22 Relocale Sk Less Thap 2¢ Square Fast 13]  Each $200,00 $2,600,00 $250.00 $3 260,00
23 {Tuft Sod 3144| SqFt $3.50 $11,004.00 $2,00 $5,288.00
Estimated Constiuction Cost $220.648.00 $178,571.83
Roosevall City
500 East Sidewatk and Straat Light Prolect (CORG)
Bld Tabutation
BId Tabulation Amaunt
1Engineer's Estimale $220.648.00
Stubbs Conalrucdon No 8id 0.00%
B Jackson Consiruction No Bld 0.00%
Eagiesmith Construction No Bld 0.00%
SC1 Automation srd Electic No Bl 0.00%
1Bodec No Bid 0.00%
Mavarick Contraclors $253,645.20 114.95%
Burdick Materials No Bid 0.00%
Sorenson Construstion No Bid 0.00%
Famsworth Excavalion $178,671.83 80.93%
CKG Asphalt $304,118.00 137.83%
Sunroc No Bld 0.00%
Wi Construction No Hld 0.00%
$0.00 4.00%




Stubbs Construction B Jackson Constructon
ltem Eslimated Unlt Unit

humber Description Quantity Winit Prlce Amount Price Amount
1 Mobllization 1 Lump $0.00 $0.00
2 ‘Trafﬁc Control i Lump $0.00 $0.00
3 Silt Fence 600f Foot 0,00 $0.00
4 9" Fiber Rolf 50} Fool $0.00 $0.00
Reconstrut Valve Box 13 Each $0.0¢ $0.00
[: Relocale Water Meler 5] Each $0.00 $0.00
7 Recenstruct Sprinkler System 28] Lump $0.00 .00
8 Remgove Tree 3| Each $0.00 $0.00
9 Remove Tree Stump 3l Each $0.00 £0.00
i0 Rermove Fence 95 Fool $0.00 $0.00
Relocate Fence 127  Foot $0.00 $0.00
Refocata Gata 3{  Esch $0.00 $0.00
Ramove Concrate Sidewalk 18] Sgvd $0.00 $0.00
4 Remove Concrelg Gurb 10|  Fool $0.00 $0,00
15 Remove Landscaps Rock And Sajyage To Qwner 106]__SyFt $0.00 $0.00
16 Remove Brick Walk And Salvags Yo Owner 183) Sgft 00 $0.00
17 Grave| Deveway 15[ Each 30 $0.00
i8 Asphalt Congrate Driveway 2} _Each $0.00 $0.00
19 Comar Padestian Access Ramp 8f Each $0.00 $0.00

20 Contcate Sldewatk 13454 54 Ft $0.00 50.00] -

21 Concrale Driveway, 13 Each $0.00 $0.00
22 Ralocate Sign Less Than 20 Squars Feet $3| Each $0.00 $0.00
23 [Tud Sod 3144 SgFl $0.00 $0.00

Tolal Project Cost No Bid No Bid

Eaglesmiiy Constnsction SCi Automation and Electric
lam Estimated Unit Unit

Mumber Description Quiantity- unlt Price Amount Price Amount
1 Mobfizalion 1 _Lump $0.00 $0.00
2 |Traffic Control 1 tump $6.00 $0.60
3 Silt Fence 50 Fout §0.00 $0.00
4 9* Flber Rel| 50f _ Foot $0.00 50.00
5 Heconstruct Valve Box 1i _ Each $0.00 50,00
[} Relocate Waler WMoter 61 Each 30,00 $0.00
7 Reconstryct Sptinkler System 20| Lump $0.00 $0.00
[ Remove Trea 3| Each $0.00 $0.00
g Remave Tree Stump 3] Each $0.00 $0.00
0 Remove Fence 8]  Foat £0.00 $0.00
Relecate Fence 127 Fool _$0.00 0.00
Refocale Gate 3t Each $0.00 $0,00
Remove Concrele Sdewslk 18| SqYd $0.00 $0.00
4 Remeye Concrele Curb 10 Foot $0.00 $0.00
15 Romove Landscape Rock And Salvage To Owner 10 ¢ FL $0.00 $0.00
[ Remove Brigk Welk And Saivage To Cwner i8 o Ft $0.00 $0.00
7 Gravel Driveway 1 Each $0.00 $0.00
8 Asphalt Concrete Drivewa Eath $0.00 $0.00
9 Cemer Pedestrian Access Ramp 8| Each _$0.00 $0.00
20 Congcrele Sidewalk 134541  SqFf 50.00 $0.00
21 Concrate Drivewa) 13} Each 0.00 0.00
22 Relocale Sign Lees Thap, 20 Stuare Feat 13|  Each 0.00 $9.00
23 JFuit Sod 3144] SqFt 040 $0.00

Total Project Cost No Bid No Bld




TEcdec Maverick Coniractors
item Eslimated Unlt Unit
Nuntber — Description Quantity Unit Price Amaunt Price Amount
Mobilization $0.00 48,500.00 $8,500.00
Traffic Controt $0.00 §  $10,000.00 $10,000.00
Silt Fence $0.00 $2.60 $1.260.00
4 9" Fiber Roil $0.00 510.5 25.00
5 Reconstruct Vaive Box $0.00 $1,500.0 $1,800.00
[ Ralocate Water Meoler $0.00 $3.500.00 $17,500.00
4 Raconstiyel Sprinkler System $0.00 300,00 $18,000.00
Ramove Tree $0.00 $1,300.00 $3.900.00 |
) Remove Tree Slump - $0.00 $950,00 $2,850,00 |
10 Remove Fence $0.00 $60.00 $460.00
11 Relucate Fence $0.00 §40.00 $6,080.00
2 Relocate Gate $0.00 $300.00 $900.00
3 Remove Concrate Sldewalk $0.00 $34.060 $612.00
4 Remove Goncrele Cusb $0.00 $5.00 | $50.00
5 Remoye Landscape Rock And Salvage To Owner $0.00 $4.50 $477.00 ¢ -
Remove Brick Walk And Salvage To Owner $0.00 $4.50 £823.50
7 Gravel Diveway $0.00 $4560.00 $6,760.00
18 - _|Asphalt Concrele Driveyay $0.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
19 Cornar Padostrian Access Ramp $0.00 $3,600,00 21,000.00
20 Goncrate Sldawalk $0.00 | $8.35 £112,340.80
21 Concrele Oriveway $0.00 $2,300,00 $25.900.00
22 Ralocate Sign Leas Than 20 Squafs Fest $0.00 $250.00 $3.250.00
23 [Turfsod $0.00 $0.95 $2,986.80
Tolat Project Cost . Ne Bid $253,845.20
Burdick Materals Seorenson Construction : -
Hom Estimated Unit talt
Number Dascriplion Quantty Unit Price Arnount Price Amount
Moblliration 1 Lump $0,00 $0.00
Teaffic Control : 1f . kump $0,00 50,00
Sl Fence 5001 Foot $0.60 $0.00 |
4 ¢* Fiber Roll 50| Foot $0.00 $0.00
8 Reconstruct Valyg Box 1| Each $0.00 $0.00
[£ Relocata Water Metar 5[ Each $6.00 $0.00
7 Reconstruct Sprinklar Systom 20 tump $0.00 $0.00
8 Remove Tree 3| Each $0.00 $0.00
9 Remove Tres Stum 3| Each $0,00 $0.00
10 Remove Fence 9f  Foot $0.00 $0.00
11 Retocate Fence 127| Foot $0.00 $0.00 |
12 alocate Gate 3y _Each $0.00 : $0.00
13 Remove Concrete Sidewalk 18]  Sovd $0.00 $0.00
14 Remove Concrele Curb 10 Fool $0.00 $0.00
5 Remeye Landscape Reck And Salvage To Owner 108{ 8SqgFl $0.00 $0.00
£ Ramava Brick Walk And Salvage To Qwner 183  SaF1 $0.00 $0.00
7 Gravet Drivevway 16, Each $0.00 $0.00
18___|Asphall Concrete Driveway 2t Each $0.00 80,00
18 |Comer Pedesifan Access Ramp _6j__Each $0.00 $0.00
20 Concrete Sldewalk 13484 SgFL $0,00 $0.00
Cancrete Driveway, 13| Each 20.00 $0,00
Rolocates Sign bess Than 2] Square Faal 13; Each $0.00 $0.00
Turf Sod 344l SgFt $0.00 $060 ] -
"Total Project Gosl No Bid No Bid




TFamsworth £xcavation CKC Asphalt
ftem Eslimated : Unit et
Number Descriglion Quantity nit Price Amount Price Amaunt
Mobllization 1) Lum $8,821.76 _$5,821.78 $17,500.00 $17,500.00
¥ |Trafﬁc Control 1| Lump $6,000.00 $6,000.00 | $20,000.00 $20,000.00
18It Fapea 500] Foot $17.00 $8,500.00 $2.10 $1,050,00
4 9" Fiber Roll 50! Foot $6.00 $300.00 $7.76 $387.50
5 Reconstruct Valve Hox 1; _Each $900.00 $200.00 562600 $526.00
Relocate Water Meter 5] Each - _$800.00 $4.600.00 $2,675.00 $12875.00
Recanstruct Sprinkter System 20 bump $400.00 $8,000.00 $780.00 $15000.00
Remcye Tras : 3|  Each $1,333.34 $4,000.02 60.00 $450.00
] Remove Trea Stump 3| Each $500.00 $4,500.00 $125.00 $376.00
Remove Fence 8] Foot $50.56 $536,04 $10,00 §90.00
Relocate Fence 127 Eoot $9.93 $1.261.11 $35.00 £4,446.00
Relocale Gate 3| Each 300,060 $800.00 $75.00 $225.00
3 Remova Cancrale Sidewalk 18] Se¥Yd 155.56 $2500.08 $21.00 $378.00
14 Remove Concrele Curt 19 Fool 150.00 $1,600.00 $22.50 $2256.00
15 |Remove Landscaps Rock And Salvage To Owner 1OB| q Ft $11.84 $1,265.84 $5.25 $566,50
16 Remove Brick Walk And Salvage To Owner 183 8qFt $7.95 $1.45668 $18. $3,284.00
17 Gravet Driveway 15| Each $360.00 $5,260.00 $64500 $9,675.00 §
18 Asphait Concrete Driveway 2] Each 750.00 $1,500.00 $3,160.00 $6,200.00
19 Comer Pedestrian Access Ramp 6f  Each $760.80 $4,600,00 $1,750.00 $10,500.00
20 Concreta Sldewalk 13454] SqFt $7.42 38579248 12,60 $1688.176.00
21 Concrets Deveway 13 Each 760,00 $9,750.00 $1,200,00 $15600.00
22 Relocate Sign Lass Than 20 Square Feet 13] Eacl $250.00 250,00 $165.00 $2,145.00
23 Turt Sod . 3144]  SqFt $2.00 $6,280.00 $4.50 $14,1468.400
Totat Project Cost $178,571.63 $304,119.00
Sunrac V1 Construction
[tem Estimaled Unit Unit
Number Dasciption Quantity Unit Price Amount_ Prica Amoupt.
1 Mobilization §f Lump $0.00 $0.00
2 . |Traffic Control 1j  Lump 0.00 $0.00
3 Silt Fence 600]  Fool £0.00 $0.60
4 I9" Fiber Rell 50 Foot §0.00 $0.00
5 Reconatruct Valve Box 1}, Each 0,00 $9.00
Relocale Water Moter B Each $0.00- $0.00
Reconstruct Sprinider System 20{ Lump $0.00 $0.00
Remove Tree 2] Each $0.60 0.00
g Remove Tree Stump 3] Each $0.00 $0001 -
i Remove Fance 8] Fool $0.00 $0.00
1 Relocate Fence 127|  Foot $0.00 $0.00
Relocale Gata 3] Each $6.00 $0.00
Ramove Concreta Sidewalk 18| _Sgvd $0.00 $0.00
4 Remoya Goncrete Gurb 16 Foot $0.00 $0.00
§ Remoye Landscaps Rock Ang Salvage Te Qwner 10_8_1 o Fi $0.00 £0,00
6 Remove Brick Watk And Sslvage To Dwrer 183  SqFt $0.00 $0.00
17 Gravel Driveway 15[ Each $0.00 $0.00) .
18 Asphall Concrete Dijveway 2] Each 30,00 $0.00 |-
19 Comear Pedestrian Access Ramp 6] _Each .00 $0.00
20 Concreta Sldewalk 13484] SqFt $0.00 $0.00
2y Concsets Driveway 13] Eagh $0.00 $0.00
22 Relocale Sign Lass Than 20 Square Foat 3] Each ; $0.00 b0.00
23 |TurtSog 3144]__SqFt $0.00 $0.00
Total Project Cost Ne Bid No Bl




